
 
Priyanka S 

 

Reply 

Reply all 

Forward 

 

 

 

 

To: 
 

Kumari AP 
Cc: 

 

Ashwini V Gopal; 
 

Bhumika M S; 
 

Satish M 
Mon 5/19/2025 5:44 PM 

Thanks, mam, for confirming, 
 
 
Hi Bhumika, 
 
Please relese the PO to inflow for the advance payment receibved. 
 

Regards, 

Priyanka.S 

Customer Success Manager 

Ph: +91-8971736678 

  

My email domain has changed 
from priyanka.s@connectivitysolutions.in to priyanka.s@cosol.in ki
ndly update your address book accordingly.  
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Kumari AP 
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Reply 

Reply all 

Forward 

 

 

 

 

To: 
 

Priyanka S 
Cc: 

 

Ashwini V Gopal; 
 

Bhumika M S; 
 

Satish M 
Mon 5/19/2025 5:31 PM 

Dear Priyanka, 
  
PFB payment received details. 
  

19 
May 
2025  

Transfer 
Credit 

 

  

N/SBIN525139634548/SBIN0002279/SEA 

 

   20,650.00 

  
  
  
Regards 
Kumari 
Accounts dept 
Connectivity IT Solutions Pvt Ltd 

8892942824 

 

PS 
 

Priyanka S 

 

Reply 

Reply all 

Forward 

https://indusnet.indusind.com/corp/BANKAWAYTRAN;jsessionid=0000tR7C5KPoiBbfYsxujAJEh7J:1ec7elmhi?bwayparam=JSWKkNvBC8TwX5Z7Tk40FH4BHt6kvzarm3bewnmBj3779wCKFh1KVsi3731WrBDwRzRku50uhE0H%0D%0AjjRumHum4nMzRbynq%2B375A%3D%3D


 

 

 

 

To: 
 

Kumari AP 
Cc: 

 

Ashwini V Gopal; 
 

Bhumika M S; 
 

Satish M 
Mon 5/19/2025 4:42 PM 

Dear Kumari mam, 

  

Greetings from Team Connectivity Solutions! 

  

Please confirm if we have received the advance payment from SPACE 
ENGINEERS ASSOCIATION 
  

Your A/c XX3674 has been debited with INR 20,650.00 on 19/05/2025 towards 
NEFT with UTR SBIN525139634548 sent to CONNECTIVITY IT SOLUTI 
INDB0001027-SBI 
  

Quote No.: CS-SQ-BLR-2025-26-000027 

  
  

Best Regards, 

Priyanka S 

Customer Success Manager 

  

Office: +91 80 26716555  Mobile: +91 8971736678 

E-mail: priyanka.s@cosol.in 

Webex Room: https://connectivitysolutions.webex.com/meet/priyanka.s 

Website: www.cosol.in 

Bangalore | Mumbai | Pune | Chennai | Kolkata| Delhi | Ahmedabad | Singapore | UK 

  

mailto:deepthi@cosol.in
mailto:deepthi@cosol.in
https://connectivitysolutions.webex.com/meet/priyanka.s
http://www.cosol.in/


My email domain has changed 
from @connectivitysolutions.in to @cosol.in kindly update your address book 
accordingly.  
    
  
 

Priyanka S 

 

Reply 

Reply all 

Forward 

 

 

 

 

To:SEA ISRO <spaceengineers.isro@gmail.com> 
Cc: 

 

Ashwini V Gopal; 
 

Satish M; 
 

Bhumika M S; 
 

Kumari AP 
Tue 5/20/2025 11:28 AM 

Dear Sir, 
 
Greetings for the Day! 
 
Thank you for your advance payment, we confirm that we have received the payment 
against the renewal of Webex order and proceeding to process the same. 
 

Regards, 

Priyanka.S 

Customer Success Manager 

Ph: +91-8971736678 

  

My email domain has changed 
from priyanka.s@connectivitysolutions.in to priyanka.s@cosol.in ki
ndly update your address book accordingly.  

http://connectivitysolutions.in/
http://cosol.in/
http://connectivitysolutions.in/
http://cosol.in/
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From: SEA ISRO <spaceengineers.isro@gmail.com> 
Sent: 19 May 2025 21:44 
To: Priyanka S <priyanka.s@cosol.in> 
Cc: Ashwini V Gopal <ashwini@cosol.in>; Satish M <satish@cosol.in> 
Subject: Re: SPACE ENGINEERS ASSOCIATION | Webex Meeting license renewal | Sub1829154 
  
 
Hello, 
 
We have made the payment today by NEFT. Reference UTR no. SBIN525139634548. 
Request you to kindly process the renewal as soon as possible.  
 
Regards, 
Vibhu Unnikrishnan 
Treasurer, SEA 
On Fri, Apr 11, 2025 at 11:37 AM Priyanka S <priyanka.s@cosol.in> wrote: 

 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

Greetings from Team Connectivity Solutions! 

  

Your webex license with subscription id Sub1829154 is going to expire on the 22-Apr-

2025, hence we would request you to kindly renew the license in order to avoid the 

service interuption. 

 
 

Attached is the formal quotation for the reference. 

 
 

Feel free to contact us if required any assistance or clarification on the same. 

  

Best Regards, 

Priyanka S 

Customer Success Manager  

  

Office: +91 80 26716555  Mobile: +91 8971736678 

E-mail: priyanka.s@cosol.in 

Webex Room: https://connectivitysolutions.webex.com/meet/priyanka.s 

Website: www.cosol.in 

mailto:priyanka.s@cosol.in
mailto:deepthi@cosol.in
mailto:deepthi@cosol.in
https://connectivitysolutions.webex.com/meet/priyanka.s
http://www.cosol.in/


Bangalore | Mumbai | Pune | Chennai | Kolkata| Delhi | Ahmedabad | Singapore | UK 

  
My email domain has changed 
from @connectivitysolutions.in to @cosol.in kindly update your address book 

accordingly.  
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