
Hi Bhumika, 
 
Please process this order. 
 
EC : NEC 
 
attached our quote and Incoming price 
 
 
 

Regards, 

Priyanka.S 

Customer Success Manager 

Ph: +91-8971736678 

  

My email domain has changed from 
priyanka.s@connectivitysolutions.in to priyanka.s@cosol.in kindly 
update your address book accordingly.  

 
From: NEC CISCO WEBEX <necciscowebex@gmail.com> 
Sent: 14 June 2024 14:13 
To: Priyanka S <priyanka.s@cosol.in> 
Subject: Re: National Engineering College - Subscription reg  
  
Yes, proceed mam with mail address "necciscowebex@gmail.com".  
Thank you 
 
On Fri, Jun 14, 2024 at 12:27 PM Priyanka S <priyanka.s@cosol.in> wrote: 

Dear Ramya Madam, 
 
As the current subscription Sub1108246 has already expired in the month of Feb we will not 
be able to renewal the same. instead, we shall be proceeding to load as a new subscription. 
 
Hence confirm here to proceed for loading as new subscription. 
 
Also kindly confirm the email id to which the Webex account should be linked. 
 
 

Regards, 

Priyanka.S 

Customer Success Manager 

Ph: +91-8971736678 

  

My email domain has changed from 
priyanka.s@connectivitysolutions.in to priyanka.s@cosol.in kindly 
update your address book accordingly.  
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From: NEC CISCO WEBEX <necciscowebex@gmail.com> 
Sent: 13 June 2024 17:23 
To: Priyanka S <priyanka.s@cosol.in> 
Subject: National Engineering College - Subscription reg  
  
Good evening priyanka,   
Iam Ramya from National Engineering College, Kovilpatti. 
I hope this email finds you well. 
I am writing to confirm that we have sent our proposal for purchase regarding quotation number CS-
SQ-BLR-2024-25-000212. However, we would like to inform you that the payment process will take 
approximately 3 to 4 days to complete. 
In light of this, we kindly request that you continue the service while the payment is being 
processed. We understand the importance of timely payments and are doing our best to expedite 
the process. 
We greatly appreciate your understanding and cooperation in this matter. Please let us know if there 
are any concerns or additional information required from our end. 
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