
On Fri, Sep 4, 2020 at 5:50 PM Muthu Raj <muthu.acmeindia@gmail.com> wrote: 
  
Dear Madam, 
  
Please issue us a Tax Invoice against our payment of Rs.14160/-. 
 
  
  
  
Thanks & Regards 
S.Muthuraj 
Senior Accountant 
ACME (India) Marketing & Services Pvt Ltd 
Nos.4 & 5, 6th Floor, Alsa Towers 
186, Poonamallee High Road, Kilpauk, Chennai 600010 
Tel: 2642 6703 - 8 (6 Lines) 
E-mail: chennai@acmeconsulting.in 
Mob : 9444555674 
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