Dear Team,

Thank you, we received the payment.

Date Type Description Credit
o Transfer
Mar N/SBIN524067826586/SBIN0070787/CEET 23,600.00

2024 Credit Ay URVEDA e ver

Regards

Kumari

Accounts dept

Connectivity IT Solutions Pvt Ltd
8892942824

From: Priyanka S <priyanka.s@cosol.in>

Sent: Thursday, March 7, 2024 5:21 PM

To: Dr Rahul Ravi <rahulrv999@gmail.com>; Kumari AP <ap.team @ Connectivitysolutions.in>
Cc: Ashwini V Gopal <ashwini@cosol.in>

Subject: Re: CEET AYURVEDA LEARNING SERVICES |

Thank you Sir,
Dear @Kumari AP Mam,

Please confirm the receival of the payment against attached quotation.

Regards,
Priyanka.S
Customer Success Manager

Ph: +91-8971736678

priyanka.s@connectivitysolutions.in to priyanka.s@cosol.in

From: Dr Rahul Ravi <rahulrv999@gmail.com>
Sent: 07 March 2024 17:17
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To: Priyanka S <privanka.s@cosol.in>
Subject: Re: CEET AYURVEDA LEARNING SERVICES |

Payment has been made. Kindly check and confirm. Please speed up the further process.

Previous purchase details are as follows

CEET AYURVEDA

sub 1D- Sub1438040
Collaboration Flex plan 3.0
Web order ID- 1300347594
Quote ID- 1200698839

Mail id- ceet.ayurveda@gmail.com

Thank you

On Tue, 5 Mar, 2024, 4:05 pm Priyanka S, <priyanka.s@cosol.in> wrote:

https://connectivitysolutions.webex.com/meet/priyanka.s

Regards,
Priyanka.S
Customer Success Manager

Ph: +91-8971736678

priyanka.s@connectivitysolutions.in to priyanka.s@cosol.in
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From: Priyanka S <priyanka.s@cosol.in>

Sent: 05 March 2024 15:33

To: rahulrv999@gmail.com <rahulrv999@gmail.com>

Cc: Ashwini V Gopal <ashwini@cosol.in>; Rajesh Krishnamurthy (rkrishn4) <rkrishn4@cisco.com>
Subject: Re: CEET AYURVEDA LEARNING SERVICES |

Dear Rahul Sir,

Understanding the urgency of activation of account we have provisioned the Trial license to
the id ' ceet.ayurveda@gmail.com' kindly verify and activate the mail sent.

Please feel free to contact us if required any assistance or clarification on the same.

Regards,
Priyanka.S
Customer Success Manager

Ph: +91-8971736678

priyanka.s@connectivitysolutions.in to priyanka.s@cosol.in

From: Priyanka S <priyanka.s@cosol.in>

Sent: 05 March 2024 15:20

To: rahulrv999@gmail.com <rahulrv999@gmail.com>

Cc: Ashwini V Gopal <ashwini@cosol.in>; Rajesh Krishnamurthy (rkrishn4) <rkrishn4@cisco.com>
Subject: Re: CEET AYURVEDA LEARNING SERVICES |

Dear Rahul Sir,
Greetings for the Day!

Please find the attached formal quotation for your reference for Cisco Webex meeting
license.

Feel free to contact us if required any assistance or clarification on the same.

Regards,
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Priyanka.S
Customer Success Manager

Ph: +91-8971736678

priyanka.s@connectivitysolutions.in to priyanka.s@cosol.in

From: Priyanka S

Sent: 05 March 2024 11:15

To: rahulrv999@gmail.com <rahulrv999@gmail.com>

Cc: Ashwini V Gopal <ashwini@cosol.in>; Rajesh Krishnamurthy (rkrishn4) <rkrishn4@cisco.com>
Subject: CEET AYURVEDA LEARNING SERVICES |

Dear Rahul Sir,

Greetings from Team Connectivity IT Solutions!

Thanks for your valuable time for connecting,as discussed we will be sharing the formal
quotation for the renewal of webex license with subscription id Sub1438040 shortly.

Request you to kindly allow some time.

Best Regards,
Priyanka S

Customer Success Manager
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Office: +91 80 26716555 Mobile: +91 8971736678

E-mail: priyanka.s@cosol.in

Webex Room: https://connectivitysolutions.webex.com/meet/priyanka.s

Website: www.cosol.in
Bangalore | Mumbai | Pune | Chennai | Kolkata| Delhi | Ahmedabad | Singapore | UK

My email domain has changed from @connectivitysolutions.in to
@cosol.in kindly update your address book accordingly.



mailto:deepthi@cosol.in
mailto:deepthi@cosol.in
https://connectivitysolutions.webex.com/meet/priyanka.s
http://www.cosol.in/
http://connectivitysolutions.in/
http://cosol.in/

