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Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in>

RFQ_SFP Module_Connectivity Sol
13 messages

Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com> Mon, Jun 15, 2020 at 5:47 PM
To: Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in>
Cc: Paritosh chheda <pchheda@euronetworldwide.com>

Dear Jason,

 

Please arrange to share your best quote for SFP Module :-

 

S NO. PART CODE PRODUCTS DESCRIPTION QTY UoM

1.0 GLC-LH-SMD= 1000BASE-LX/LH SFP transceiver module, SMF, 1310nm, DOM 4 Nos

 

Kindly share quote for both single port & Dual Port.

 

With Regards,

Akshata Shirke

(Commercial Team)

Landline no: 022-39397241 . Mobile no: 9920082478.

Euronet Services India Pvt.Ltd.

I-Think Techno Campus, Office No. 1, 8th Floor, Wing “A”, Off Pokhran Road No. 2,

Behind TCS, Eastern Express Highway, Thane(W)– 400 607.
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Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com> Mon, Jun 15, 2020 at 5:50 PM
To: Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in>
Cc: Paritosh chheda <pchheda@euronetworldwide.com>

Dear Jason,

 

Refer below details for more information.
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With Regards,

Akshata

9920082478



6/18/2020 Connectivity IT Solutions Pvt Ltd Mail - RFQ_SFP Module_Connectivity Sol

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b0f751ef64&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1669567319310787715&simpl=msg-f%3A1669567319310787715&simpl=msg-f%3A1669819567711734885&simpl=msg… 4/17

[Quoted text hidden]

Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in> Tue, Jun 16, 2020 at 8:15 PM
To: Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com>
Cc: Paritosh chheda <pchheda@euronetworldwide.com>, Ruchesh Bhanushali <ruchesh@connectivitysolutions.in>

Dear Akshata,

Greetings from Team Connectivity Solutions!

Please find attached proposal for your kind reference.

Please Note:- 

1.The delivery timeline is 7 working Days from the receipt of firm purchase order.
2.The above pricing is valid only till 23rd June'20 and the USD rates may get revised. Kindly ask for revised pricing post the expiry of quote validity. 
3.please confirm and validate the above Bill of Material, kindly re-validate the BoQ before placing the order. 

4.All taxes will be charged extra as applicable at the time of billing.

Best Regards,

Jason Lobo
Account Manager - Sales

Description: Description: Description: C:\Users\Abhi\AppData\Local\Temp\ksohtml\wpsBAA4.tmp.png

Mobile: +91 84469 13891
jason@connectivitysolutions.in

Bangalore | Mumbai | Chennai | Delhi | Ahmedabad | Singapore

mailto:jason@connectivitysolutions.in
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Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in> Wed, Jun 17, 2020 at 9:43 AM
To: Trupti Tawde <trupti@connectivitysolutions.in>
Cc: Ruchesh Bhanushali <ruchesh@connectivitysolutions.in>

Hi Trupti Madam,

Please confirm if customer place an order today for 4 qty module,can we arrange pickup tomorrow for module from andheri (Chandra tech) and deliver it at thane euronet

Best Regards,

Jason Lobo
Account Manager - Sales

Description: Description: Description: C:\Users\Abhi\AppData\Local\Temp\ksohtml\wpsBAA4.tmp.png

Mobile: +91 84469 13891
jason@connectivitysolutions.in

Bangalore | Mumbai | Chennai | Delhi | Ahmedabad | Singapore
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Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in> Wed, Jun 17, 2020 at 12:04 PM
To: Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com>, Deepesh Seth <dseth@euronetworldwide.com>
Cc: Paritosh chheda <pchheda@euronetworldwide.com>, Ruchesh Bhanushali <ruchesh@connectivitysolutions.in>

++Deepesh Sir++

Best Regards,

Jason Lobo
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Account Manager - Sales
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Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com> Wed, Jun 17, 2020 at 12:08 PM
To: Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in>
Cc: Paritosh chheda <pchheda@euronetworldwide.com>, Ruchesh Bhanushali <ruchesh@connectivitysolutions.in>, Deepesh Seth <dseth@euronetworldwide.com>

Dear Jason,

 

We issued earlier Po @ Unit Price 19,250/- Lets process this Po with same cost.

 

mailto:jason@connectivitysolutions.in
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Please confirm on the same.

 

With Regards,

Akshata

9920082478

 

From: Jason Lobo [mailto:jason@connectivitysolutions.in] 
Sent: 17 June 2020 12:04 PM
To: Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com>; Deepesh Seth <dseth@euronetworldwide.com>
Cc: Paritosh chheda <pchheda@euronetworldwide.com>; Ruchesh Bhanushali <ruchesh@connectivitysolutions.in>
Subject: Re: RFQ_SFP Module_Connec�vity Sol

 

External Sender: Use Cau�on

 

[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]

On Mon, Jun 15, 2020 at 5:47 PM Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com> wrote:

[Quoted text hidden]

Deepesh Seth <dseth@euronetworldwide.com> Wed, Jun 17, 2020 at 1:00 PM
To: Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com>, Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in>
Cc: Paritosh chheda <pchheda@euronetworldwide.com>, Ruchesh Bhanushali <ruchesh@connectivitysolutions.in>

Hello Akshata,

 

mailto:jason@connectivitysolutions.in
mailto:akshirke@euronetworldwide.com
mailto:dseth@euronetworldwide.com
mailto:pchheda@euronetworldwide.com
mailto:ruchesh@connectivitysolutions.in
mailto:akshirke@euronetworldwide.com
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Please include 4 nos. LC-LC Single Mode patch cords or 3 or 5 meters with the modules.

 

Regards

Deepesh Seth

 

 

From: Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, June 17, 2020 12:09 PM
To: Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in>

[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]

Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com> Wed, Jun 17, 2020 at 2:11 PM
To: Deepesh Seth <dseth@euronetworldwide.com>, Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in>
Cc: Paritosh chheda <pchheda@euronetworldwide.com>, Ruchesh Bhanushali <ruchesh@connectivitysolutions.in>

Hi Jason,

 

As discussed, please share the final quote with cords asap.

 

With Regards,

Akshata

9920082478

[Quoted text hidden]

Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in> Wed, Jun 17, 2020 at 2:12 PM
To: Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com>

mailto:akshirke@euronetworldwide.com
mailto:jason@connectivitysolutions.in
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Cc: Deepesh Seth <dseth@euronetworldwide.com>, Paritosh chheda <pchheda@euronetworldwide.com>, Ruchesh Bhanushali <ruchesh@connectivitysolutions.in>

Hi Akshata,

I am working on it,will revert back shortly.

Best Regards,

Jason Lobo
Account Manager - Sales
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Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in> Wed, Jun 17, 2020 at 4:06 PM
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To: Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com>
Cc: Deepesh Seth <dseth@euronetworldwide.com>, Paritosh chheda <pchheda@euronetworldwide.com>, Ruchesh Bhanushali <ruchesh@connectivitysolutions.in>

Hi Akshata,

Greetings from Team Connectivity Solutions!

Please find attached proposal for your kind reference.

Kindly share the purchase order at the earliest .

Please Note:- 

1.The delivery timeline is 7 working Days from the receipt of firm purchase order.
2.The above pricing is valid only till 23rd June'20 and the USD rates may get revised. Kindly ask for revised pricing post the expiry of quote validity.
3.please confirm and validate the above Bill of Material, kindly re-validate the BoQ before placing the order.

4.All taxes will be charged extra as applicable at the time of billing.

Best Regards,

Jason Lobo
Account Manager - Sales

Description: Description: Description: C:\Users\Abhi\AppData\Local\Temp\ksohtml\wpsBAA4.tmp.png

Mobile: +91 84469 13891
jason@connectivitysolutions.in

Bangalore | Mumbai | Chennai | Delhi | Ahmedabad | Singapore

mailto:jason@connectivitysolutions.in
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Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com> Thu, Jun 18, 2020 at 12:20 PM
To: Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in>
Cc: Deepesh Seth <dseth@euronetworldwide.com>, Paritosh chheda <pchheda@euronetworldwide.com>, Ruchesh Bhanushali <ruchesh@connectivitysolutions.in>

Dear Jason,
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We have received approval from management, please process further.

 

You will receive Po shortly.

 

     Connec�vity Soln_16.06.2020

S
NO.

PART CODE PRODUCTS DESCRIPTION QTY UoM UNIT PRICE (INR) EXTENDED PRICE

       

1.0 GLC-LH-SMD= 1000BASE-LX/LH SFP transceiver module, MMF/SMF, 1310nm, DOM 4 Nos                     21,500                     86,000

 

With Regards,

Akshata

9920082478

 

From: Jason Lobo [mailto:jason@connectivitysolutions.in] 
Sent: 17 June 2020 04:07 PM
To: Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com>
Cc: Deepesh Seth <dseth@euronetworldwide.com>; Paritosh chheda <pchheda@euronetworldwide.com>; Ruchesh Bhanushali <ruchesh@
connectivitysolutions.in>
Subject: Re: RFQ_SFP Module_Connec�vity Sol

 

Hi Akshata,

 

Greetings from Team Connectivity Solutions!

mailto:jason@connectivitysolutions.in
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Please find attached proposal for your kind reference.

Kindly share the purchase order at the earliest .

 

 

 

Please Note:- 

1.The delivery timeline is 7 working Days from the receipt of firm purchase order.
2.The above pricing is valid only till 23rd June'20 and the USD rates may get revised. Kindly ask for revised pricing post the expiry of quote validity.
3.please confirm and validate the above Bill of Material, kindly re-validate the BoQ before placing the order.

4.All taxes will be charged extra as applicable at the time of billing.

 

 

Best Regards,

Jason Lobo

Account Manager - Sales

Descrip�on: Descrip�on: Descrip�on: C:\Users\Abhi\AppData\Local\Temp\ksohtml\wpsBAA4.tmp.png

Mobile: +91 84469 13891
jason@connectivitysolutions.in

Bangalore | Mumbai | Chennai | Delhi | Ahmedabad | Singapore

Description: cid:image003.png@01D44C28.1EBE7C70

 

 

On Wed, Jun 17, 2020 at 2:12 PM Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in> wrote:
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Hi Akshata,

 

I am working on it,will revert back shortly.

 

 

Best Regards,

Jason Lobo

Account Manager - Sales

Mobile: +91 84469 13891
jason@connectivitysolutions.in

Bangalore | Mumbai | Chennai | Delhi | Ahmedabad | Singapore

 

 

On Wed, Jun 17, 2020 at 2:11 PM Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com> wrote:

[Quoted text hidden]

++Deepesh Sir++

[Quoted text hidden]

Mobile: +91 84469 13891
jason@connectivitysolutions.in

[Quoted text hidden]

 

[Quoted text hidden]

Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com> Thu, Jun 18, 2020 at 12:37 PM
To: Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in>
Cc: Deepesh Seth <dseth@euronetworldwide.com>, Paritosh chheda <pchheda@euronetworldwide.com>, Ruchesh Bhanushali <ruchesh@connectivitysolutions.in>

Dear Jason,

mailto:jason@connectivitysolutions.in
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We will issue Po as per revised quote.

 

S
NO.

PART CODE PRODUCTS DESCRIPTION QTY UoM UNIT PRICE (INR) EXTENDED PRICE

       

1.0 GLC-LH-SMD= 1000BASE-LX/LH SFP transceiver module, MMF/SMF, 1310nm, DOM 4 Nos                     21,000                     84,000

 

 

With Regards,

Akshata

9920082478

[Quoted text hidden]

Proposal.pdf
162K

Jason Lobo <jason@connectivitysolutions.in> Thu, Jun 18, 2020 at 12:44 PM
To: Akshata Shirke <akshirke@euronetworldwide.com>
Cc: Deepesh Seth <dseth@euronetworldwide.com>, Paritosh chheda <pchheda@euronetworldwide.com>, Ruchesh Bhanushali <ruchesh@connectivitysolutions.in>

Hi Akshata,

Thanks for the email confirmation.

will proceed further and keep you posted.
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Best Regards,

Jason Lobo
Account Manager - Sales

Description: Description: Description: C:\Users\Abhi\AppData\Local\Temp\ksohtml\wpsBAA4.tmp.png

Mobile: +91 84469 13891
jason@connectivitysolutions.in

Bangalore | Mumbai | Chennai | Delhi | Ahmedabad | Singapore
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