From: Kumari AP <ap.team@connectivitysolutions.in>

Sent: 02 December 2021 12:16 PM

To: Meenakshi <meenakshi@connectivitysolutions.in>; Ramakrishna Badireddy
<krishna@talentas.in>

Cc: Srinivas Katarapu <srinivas.k@talentas.in>; Sandeep Dachepally <sandeep@talentas.in>; Deepthi
Shree <deepthi@connectivitysolutions.in>; sravanthi <sravanthi@connectivitysolutions.in>; Sarthak
Jain (sarthjai) <sarthjai@cisco.com>; Vivek Balaji <vivek@connectivitysolutions.in>; Manjunatha C
<manju@connectivitysolutions.in>; sagar shah <sagar@connectivitysolutions.in>; Madhusudhanan
<madhu@connectivitysolutions.in>

Subject: Re: Greetings from Cisco | Talentas Technology | New office Setup

Dear Krishna sir,

For rental, Please deduct Tds 2% under section 1941 and do the needful.
Regards

Kumari

Accounts dept

Connectivity IT Solutions Pvt Ltd

On Thu, Dec 2, 2021 at 12:09 PM Meenakshi <meenakshi@connectivitysolutions.in> wrote:

Dear Krishna Sir,
Thank you for the confirmation, we will dispatch the materials soon.
Best Regards,

Meenakshi.N

Office: +91 080 26716555 Mobile: +91 9148981604

meenakshi@connectivitysolutions.in
Bangalore | Mumbai | Chennai | Delhi | Ahmedabad | Singapore
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From: Ramakrishna Badireddy <krishna@talentas.in>
Sent: 02 December 2021 11:45 AM
To: Meenakshi <meenakshi@connectivitysolutions.in>; Srinivas Katarapu <srinivas.k@talentas.in>
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Cc: Sandeep Dachepally <sandeep@talentas.in>; 'Deepthi Shree'
<deepthi@connectivitysolutions.in>; 'sravanthi' <sravanthi@connectivitysolutions.in>; 'Sarthak Jain
(sarthjai)' <sarthjai@cisco.com>; 'Vivek Balaji' <vivek@connectivitysolutions.in>; 'Manjunatha C'
<manju@connectivitysolutions.in>; 'sagar shah' <sagar@connectivitysolutions.in>;
'Madhusudhanan' <madhu@connectivitysolutions.in>

Subject: RE: Greetings from Cisco | Talentas Technology | New office Setup

Dear Meenakshi,

Please find the rental receipt for the first month. | will deduct 10% TDS for the 3 months in
the last month.

Kindly send the devices as early as possible.

Payment Of INR 24,780.00 to ConnectivitylTSolutions

669796567

TALENTAS TECHNOLOGY PRIVATE LIMITED
176905000516

ConnectivitylTSolutions

650014093208

02/12/2021

Meraki Rent Dec21

NEFT
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