Dear Ashwini Madam,

You may please prepare the Invoice in the name of
President, ADOSSEF.

Name: Sri. S. Murugan

Phone: 94471 01330

Email: smurugan veeranam@yaho00.co.in

gHe™eT 9ed / Regards,

A. SENTHIL KUMAR

Sci/ Engr SG

Head, Program Planning & Evaluation Cell
PCM Entity

VSSC/ISRO

Phone : 0471-256-3813
Mobile: 9633121268

On 2021-08-05 11:07, Senthil Kumar A wrote:
Dear Ashwini Madam,

| am writing on Behalf of All India Department of Space SC/ST Employees Federation
(ADOSSEF), with members from all Centres of ISRO all over India.

We had received your Quote No.: CS-SQ-BLR-2021-22-000065, dated April 16, 2021 for Webex
Meeting account for ADOSSEF.

The ADOSSEF Core Committee has cleared the purchase of Webex.
The Quote was Rs. 15, 250.00

The Core Committee has requested for a discount, taking account that this is a welfare Association
for the benefit of SC/ST Employees of ISRO and the discussion will be aimed at their upliftment.

Hence, you are requested to please inform if you can extend a discount to ADOSSEF.

Reference Email: adossef@gmail.com

You are requested to kindly do the needful and advice on future action from my side.
gyewAet dfgd / Regards,

A. SENTHIL KUMAR
Sci/ Engr SG
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