
From: Anil Kumar S <anil.kumar@reqstech.com>  
Sent: 19 May 2021 13:12 
To: Meenakshi <meenakshi@connectivitysolutions.in> 
Cc: Shivakumar <shivakumar@connectivitysolutions.in>; Deepthi Gowda 
<deepthi@connectivitysolutions.in> 
Subject: Re: REQS Technologies-VPN License  
  
Hi Meenakshi, 
  
Please proceed with the licences I’ll update the payment confirmation shortly. 

Regards, 

Anil Kumar S 

Director 

REQS Technologies India Pvt Ltd 

Mob:9980990936 

E-Mail:anil.kumar@reqstech.com 
 
 
From: Anil Kumar <anil.kumar@reqstech.com>  
Sent: 21 May 2021 16:31 
To: Meenakshi <meenakshi@connectivitysolutions.in> 
Cc: Shivakumar <shivakumar@connectivitysolutions.in> 
Subject: Re: REQS Technologies-VPN License  
 
Hi Meenakshi, 
 
PFA Payment Details. 
 

 
 
Regards, 
Anil Kumar S 
Director 
REQS Techologies India Pvt Ltd 
Mob:9980990936 
Off:080-28444323 
E-Mail:anil.kumar@reqstech.com 
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