Priyanka S

From: Kumari AP <ap.team@Connectivitysolutions.in>
Sent: Thursday, November 27, 2025 3:54 PM

To: Priyanka S

Cc: Ashwini V. Gopal; DGPO ASR DISTRICT
Subject: RE: CONFORMATION MAIL - REG WEBEX

Dear Priyanka,

Yes we received the below payment.

27-11-2025 11:38:21 S38522809 Credit N/SBIN525331098397/SBIN00614¢

Regards

Kumari

Accounts dept

Connectivity IT Solutions Pvt Ltd
8892942824

From: Priyanka S <priyanka.s@cosol.in>

Sent: 27 November 2025 15:41

To: DGPO ASR DISTRICT <dpoasrpaderu@gmail.com>; Kumari AP <ap.team@Connectivitysolutions.in>
Cc: Ashwini V Gopal <ashwini@cosol.in>

Subject: Re: CONFORMATION MAIL - REG WEBEX

++
Thank you sir,
Dear @Kumari Mam,

Please confirm on the receival of the payment against attached quotation and payment details.

Regards,

Priyanka.S

Customer Success Manager
Ph: +91-8971736678

priyanka.s@connectivitysolutions.in

priyanka.s@cosol.in



From: DGPO ASR DISTRICT <dpoasrpaderu@gmail.com>
Sent: 27 November 2025 15:24

To: Priyanka S <priyanka.s@cosol.in>

Subject: CONFORMATION MAIL - REG WEBEX

We are confirming your Webex - Meeting Center
Sir/ Madam,

Please go through the following attachment

with regards
District Gram Panchayat Officer
Alluri Sitharama Raju District









